
 
     Wisconsin Rapids Public School District – Board of Education 
     510 Peach Street 
 Wisconsin Rapids, WI  54494 (715) 424–6701 
 
     Business Services Committee 

John Benbow, Jr., Chairperson 
Christopher Inda, Member 

Julie Timm, Member 
John A. Krings, President 

June 3, 2024 
 

LOCATION: Board of Education Office, 510 Peach Street, Wisconsin Rapids, WI 54494  
  Conference Room C 
 

 
TIME: Immediately following the Educational Services Committee Meeting, but not before 6:15 p.m. 

 
I. Call to Order 

 
II. Public Comment 

 
Persons who wish to address members of the Committee may make a statement pertaining to a 
specific agenda item.  The Committee Chair will establish limits for speakers due to time 
constraints.  Comments made by the public shall be civil in content and tone.  Speakers bear the 
personal risk if comments made are defamatory, slanderous, or otherwise harmful to another 
individual.  Please keep in mind that this is a Committee meeting of the Board open to the public, 
and not a public hearing. 

 
III. Actionable Items 

 
A. Visitor Management System for Schools - Approval 
B. Supply Bid - Approval 

 
IV. Updates and Reports 

 
A. Purchases - Update 
B. Basketball Backboard Donation - Update 

 
V. Agenda Items 

 
VI. Future Agenda Items 

 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
The Wisconsin open meetings law requires that the Board, or Board Committee, only take action on subject matter that is noticed on their respective agendas.  Persons wishing to place items on the 
agenda should contact the District Office at 715–424–6701, at least seven working days prior to the meeting date for the item to be considered.  The item may be referred to the appropriate committee 
or placed on the Board agenda as determined by the Superintendent and/or Board president. 
  
With advance notice, efforts will be made to accommodate the needs of persons with disabilities by providing a sign language interpreter or other auxiliary aids, by calling 715–424–6701. 
  
School Board members may attend the above Committee meeting(s) for information gathering purposes.  If a quorum of Board members should appear at any of the Committee meetings, a regular 
School Board meeting may take place for purposes of gathering information on an item listed on one of the Committee agendas.  If such a meeting should occur, the date, time, and location of the Board 
meeting will be that of the particular Committee as listed on the Committee agenda how ever, no deliberation or action w ill be taken by other Committees or the full Board of Education. 

 
 
 

AGENDA 





 
Wisconsin Rapids Public School District – Board of Education 

     510 Peach Street 
 Wisconsin Rapids, WI  54494 (715) 424–6701 
 

Business Services Committee 
John Benbow, Jr., Chairperson 

Christopher Inda, Member 
Julie Timm, Member 

John A. Krings, President 
 

June 3, 2024 
 
LOCATION: Board of Education Office, 510 Peach Street, Wisconsin Rapids, WI 54494  

 Conference Room C 
 

TIME:  Immediately following the Educational Services Committee Meeting, but not before 6:15 p.m. 
 

I. Call to Order 
 

II. Public Comment 
 

III. Actionable Items 
 

A. Visitor Management System for Schools – Approval 
 

The District currently uses the Raptor Visitor Management system for our background check 
system when visitors check into our schools, temporary badges and keeps a log of who is signed 
into our buildings throughout the day.   

 
The District has piloted Verkada Guest Access, a visitor management system offered by 
Heartland Business Systems. This system was tested to look for an updated solution with some 
additional features that were not currently offered by Raptor. Verkada Guest Access offers 
customization at each building, full integration with appropriate background checks, and many 
enhanced features including text messaging capabilities to those signed in (see Attachment A). 
 
The administration recommends approval for the purchase of a 5-year license to the 
Verkada Guest Visitor Management system and all included hardware from Heartland 
Business Systems at a total cost of $36,187.25 to be funded from a combination of the 
District Technology budget, Buildings and Grounds Budget, and the Technology 
Referendum budget.  

 
B. Supply Bid - Approval 

 
Each school year the Building and Grounds Department obtains bids for clay, colored paper, 
custodial supplies, general supplies, and nursing supplies. The total cost of the bids from 
multiple vendors is $114,828.26 (see Attachment B). 
 
The administration recommends approval of accepting these bids from multiple vendors 
for a total cost of $114,828.26 to be paid out of the 2024-25 District Supply Budget. 

 
 
 
 
 
 

BACKGROUND 



IV. Updates and Reports

A. Purchases - Update

Copies of the following invoices, bid specs, and purchase orders will be reviewed:
- BG Innovations - $19,165.00 - Technology Budget - BenQ Flat Panel Displays
- City of Wis Rapids - $17,017.70 - Fund 80 - Police Liaison Services
- PDS - $44,400.00 - Common School Library Fund Budget - Chromebooks
- Tweet Garot - $15,000.00 - B&G Budget - Alternating Tread Staircase and Roof Access

Installation

B. Basketball Backboard Donation - Update

The Bell Family Charitable Foundation has donated $3,000.00 for the basketball backboards at 
Grant Elementary. This equipment will be part of the playground project at Grant. A formal 
thank you letter will be sent to the Bell Family Charitable Foundation for this donation.  

V. Agenda Items

Committee members will be asked which agenda items from the Committee meeting will be 
placed on the consent agenda for the regular Board of Education meeting. 

VI. Future Agenda Items



Attachment A





WRPS REF 

# DESCRIPTION OF PRODUCT QTY

UNIT OF 

MEASURE No Sub Vendor / Manuf. #

QUOTED 

PRICE Item # Total

QUOTED 

PRICE Item # Total

QUOTED 

PRICE Brand Total

QUOTED 

PRICE Brand Total

CP900

COLORED PAPER, 20#, 8.5" X 11", BLUE; MULTIPURPOSE 20# BOND, 5000 

SHEETS PER CASE, OR EQUIVALENT 200 REAMS X Leading Edge or Domtar $5.50

Leading Edge 

or Domtar $1,100.00 5.85 domtar 94284 1,170.00

CP901

COLORED PAPER, 20#, 8.5" X 11", BUFF; MULTIPURPOSE 20# BOND, 5000 

SHEETS PER CASE, OR EQUIVALENT 30 REAMS X Leading Edge or Domtar disc.

Leading Edge 

or Domtar disc.

CP902

COLORED PAPER, 20#, 8.5" X 11", CANARY; MULTIPURPOSE 20# BOND, 

5000 SHEETS PER CASE, OR EQUIVALENT 240 REAMS X Leading Edge or Domtar $5.50

Leading Edge 

or Domtar $1,320.00 5.85 domtar 94290 1,404.00

CP903

COLORED PAPER, 20#, 8.5" X 11", GOLD; MULTIPURPOSE 20# BOND, 5000 

SHEETS PER CASE, OR EQUIVALENT 200 REAMS X Leading Edge or Domtar $5.50

Leading Edge 

or Domtar $1,100.00 5.85 domtar 94299 1,170.00

CP904

COLORED PAPER, 20#, 8.5" X 11", GREEN; MULTIPURPOSE 20# BOND, 5000 

SHEETS PER CASE, OR EQUIVALENT 140 REAMS X Leading Edge or Domtar $5.50

Leading Edge 

or Domtar $770.00 5.85 domtar 94304 $819.00

CP906

COLORED PAPER, 20#, 8.5" X 11", PINK; MULTIPURPOSE 20# BOND, 5000 

SHEETS PER CASE, OR EQUIVALENT 100 REAMS X Leading Edge or Domtar $5.50

Leading Edge 

or Domtar $550.00 5.85 domtar 94314 585

CP907

COLORED PAPER, 20#, 8.5" X 11", SALMON; MULTIPURPOSE 20# BOND, 

5000 SHEETS PER CASE, OR EQUIVALENT 70 REAMS X Leading Edge or Domtar $5.50

Leading Edge 

or Domtar $385.00 5.85 domtar 94318 409.5

CP908

COPY PAPER, 20#, 8.5" X 14", WHITE; MULTIPURPOSE 20# BOND, 5000 

SHEETS PER CASE, OR EQUIVALENT 40 REAMS X Leading Edge or Domtar $4.53

Leading Edge 

or Domtar $181.20 5.9

domrtar/mete

or $236.00

CP909

COLORED PAPER, 20#, 8.5" X 11", CHERRY; MULTIPURPOSE 20# BOND, 

5000 SHEETS PER CASE, OR EQUIVALENT 30 REAMS X Leading Edge or Domtar disc.

Leading Edge 

or Domtar disc.

CP910

COLORED PAPER, 20#, 8.5" X 11", GRAY; MULTIPURPOSE 20# BOND, 5000 

SHEETS PER CASE, OR EQUIVALENT 40 REAMS X Leading Edge or Domtar $5.50

Leading Edge 

or Domtar $220.00 5.85 domtar 94302 234

CP911

COLORED PAPER, 20#, 8.5" X 11", ORCHID; MULTIPURPOSE 20# BOND, 5000 

SHEETS PER CASE, OR EQUIVALENT 200 REAMS X Leading Edge or Domtar $5.50

Leading Edge 

or Domtar $1,100.00 5.85 domtar 94311 1,170.00

CP913

COPY PAPER, 20#, 11" X 17", WHITE; MULTIPURPOSE 20# BOND, 2500 

SHEETS PER CASE, OR EQUIVALENT 40 REAMS X Leading Edge or Domtar $7.10

Leading Edge 

or Domtar $284.00 9.35

domtar/meteo

r 374

Total $7,010.20

Overall Total $7,010.20

Marshfield Book

NO BID NO BID

COLORED PAPER BID

Results - Pricing held until 6/30/24
Complete Office Midland School Specialty

Attachment B





blue highlight = brand specifc

UNIT OF

WRPS REF # DESCRIPTION OF PRODUCT QTY MEASURE NO SUB Quoted Price Vendor Item # Total Quoted Price Vendor Item # Total Quoted Price Vendor Item # Total Quoted Price Vendor Item # Notes Total Quoted Price Vendor Item # Total Approx. Quoted Price

Vendor/Manuf 

# Quoted Total

PC001 Boroxo Powered Hand Soap, 10/cs 8 Box X $8.37 WEDPHS4-6 $66.96 $13.43

ZRG4556797 

Worx 

Boraxo is 

discontinued, $107.44

PC007 Enzyme Drain Opener, Carroll #26923 12/cs 12 Case X $49.11 N-02008 $589.32

PC008 ABC Bowl Cleaner, 12/cs #61140257 6 Case X $31.89 N-02004 $191.34

PC009 Graffiti Wipes Containers, Claire, 6/cs 6 Cans X $15.53 CL963 $93.18 $81.01 Claire $486.07

PC010 Xenit Graffiti Remover, 12/cs 12 Cans X

PC015 3M Spray Bottle #20 6 Each X $3.68 503T20 $22.08

PC016 3M Spray Bottle #20 12 Each X $3.68 503T02 $44.16

PC017 3M Spray Bottle #4 12 Each X $4.30 503T04 $51.60

PC022 3M 2L Heavy Duty Multi-Surface, 6 boxes/case 36 Box X $29.81 19202 $1,073.16 $200.04 3M $7,201.30

PC023 3M 3H Neutral Cleaner, 6 boxes/case 72 Box X $26.85 20200 $1,933.20 $187.45 3M $13,496.09

PC024 3M 4L Bathroom Cleaner, 6 boxes/case 78 Box X $93.03 18204 $7,256.34 $544.31 3M $42,456.32

PC025 3M 5H Quat Disinfectant, 6 boxes/case 18 Box X $22.34 23219 $402.12 $173.01 3M $3,114.22

PC029 3M 8L General Purpose Cleaner, 6 boxes/case 6 Box X $50.78 19211 $304.68 $162.15 3M $972.94

PC030 3M 9H Extraction Cleaner, 6 boxes/case 12 Box X $14.42 34857 $173.04 $87.50 3M $1,049.93

PC031 Chewing Gum Remover, 6oz, 12/cs 12 Cans $75.00 PER CASE - BETCO: BE00923 $75.00 $5.80 CL813 $69.60 $69.00 spartan 64450 $828.00 $4.67

ARM1001654 

Misty Gum 

must order 12 

ea $56.04 $50.87 3M $610.41

PC040 3M Scotch Brite Pads GREEN #86, 12/bx 12 Box X $22.08 EA - 3M $1,324.80 $15.27 5509 $183.24 $85.60 MMM86CT $1,027.20 $19.21 ZMM86 $230.52 $25.87/box $310.44 $44.05 3M $528.65

PC042 3M Cleansing Sponge #63, 20/bx 12 Box X $29.52 EA - 3M $1,771.20 $33.80 8251 $405.60 $61.25 MMM08251 $735.00 $42.83 MM63 $513.96 $57.69/box $692.28 $35.48 3M $425.78

PC055 3M Floor Pads, 14", Black 7200 4 Box X $13.16 EA - 3M $52.64 $18.05 8376 $72.20 $24.75 3M08376 $99.00 $19.69 MMTL14 $78.76 $17.48 3M $69.93

PC056 3M Floor Pads, 14", Red 5100 10 Box X $41.80 EA - 3M $836.00 $17.05 8389 $170.50 $23.95 HE08389-FK $239.50 $19.65 MM14RED $196.50 $16.99 3M $169.88

PC070 3M Floor Pads, 20", Black 7200 4 Box X $17.16 EA - 3M $343.20 $25.83 8382 $103.32 $40.50 3M08382 $162.00 $33.72 MMTL20 $134.88 $29.42 3M $117.69

PC080

Rubber Maid Sanitary Napki Recpetable Liners 

#6141, 250/pkg 36 Pkg X $36.51 PER CASE - RUBBERMAID $1,314.36 $20.12

FG614100000

0 $724.32 $28.30 RCP6141 $1,018.80 $22.29 RU6141 $802.44 $36.25/pkg $1,305.00 $25.94 Rubbermaid $933.83

PC081

Wypall L20 Paper Wiper White, 12/5"x13", 1/4 

fold, 816/cs 50 Case X $93.63 PER CASE - KC $4,681.50 $63.78 47022 $3,189.00 $66.50 KC 47022 $3,325.00 $79.89 KC47022 $3,994.50 $79.94 KC $3,997.09

PC081

Wypall L20 Paper Wiper Brown, 12/5"x13", 1/4 

fold, 816/cs 50 Case X $33.08 HBZ48LNR01 $1,654.00 -

PC087

12-16 Gallon Can Liners, CBC-HCR 33MC 

24"x33", 20/50's 75 Case X $22.20

CBC-HCR 33 

MC $1,665.00 $26.76 XX24338C $2,007.00 $2,259.04 CBC-HCR 33 MC $30.12

PC087 12-16 Gallon Can Liners, N-02137, 24"x33" 75 Case X $33.08 PER CASE - HBZ48LNR01 $2,481.00 $25.68 N-02137 $1,926.00 $67.60

HERZ4833LNR

01 $5,070.00 $27.76

PPVMR24330

MC $2,082.00

PC089

33 Gallon Can Liners, Redwood, UNC-UL-06H 

20x13x40, 250/cs 450 Case X $15.91 PER CASE - HBX6639PK $7,159.50 $44.30 UNC-UL-06H $19,935.00 $16.91 JAFS06H $7,609.50

PC094

Rubbermaid Slim Jim Gray, FG354060-Gray, 16 

Gal 3 Each X $64.08 EA - RUBBERMAID $192.24 $48.76

FG354060GRA

Y $146.28 $49.95 RCP354060GY $149.85 $32.17 RU354060G $96.51 $62.44 $187.32 $34.61 Rubbermaid $103.84

PC097 Conversion Dolly for Rubber Maid 32 Gal. Can 4 Each X $65.66 EACH - RUBBERMAID $262.64 $37.17 FG264000BLA $148.68 $38.15 RCP264000BK $152.60 $29.53 RU2640BLK $118.12 $62.13 $248.52

PC099 Geer Press Wool Duster 18 Each X $6.42 EACH - LA350EX $115.56 $11.33 3103 $203.94 $10.24 RU9C04 RUBBERMAID $184.32 $3.88 $69.75

PC100 Fuller Toilet Mop/Swab, #2968, 12 ct 72 Each X $1.85 EA - TO280105 $133.20 $7.30 MI2968 $525.60

PC126

Rubbermaid Dual Moss Heavy Duty Floor 

Squeegee, 30", FG9C2900 8 Each X $25.19 EA - RUBBERMAID $201.52 $24.18

FG96C2900BL

A $193.44 $12.24 RU9C2900

MUST ORDER 

10 EA $97.92 $23.36 Rubbermaid $186.89

PC128 Wet Mop Handle, 60", ODEL 12 Each X $15.19 N-02403 $182.28 $9.96 RH5160 RUBBERMAID $119.52

PC129 Algoma Mophead, ER424WF, Waxing 144 Each X $10.02 EACH - ALGOMA $1,442.88

PC130 Algoma Mophead, E424WF, Cleaning 240 Each X $9.21 EACH - ALGOMA $2,210.40

PC134 Unger Razor Blade Scraper #SR040 50 Each X $4.88 SR040 $244.00 $3.95 UNGSR040 $197.50 $3.49 UNGSR040 $174.50 $4.21 $210.50 $3.49 Unger $174.43

PC135

Razor Blades, heavy duty steel back single edge, 

.12"x.3048 mm 12 Each $23.40 UNGSRB30 $280.80

PC136 Vacuum Bags, Generic Windsor, 10/pkg 100 Pkg X $20.11 PKG - WINDSOR $2,011.00 $9.94 86000460C $994.00 $16.52 $1,652.00

PC140

Best Scent Water Soluale Deoderant, Betco # 

2351212/cs 14 Case X $32.51 Betco $455.08

PC143 Wet Floor signs 12 Each $17.58 EA - RUBBERMAID $210.96 $13.47 FG611277YEL $161.64 $17.90 FG611277YEL $214.80 $8.91 RU6112 RUBBERMAID $106.92 $10.11 $121.35

PC149 TS Orange Squirt Concentrate, 4 gal/cs 24 Gallon X $29.86 4255041 $716.64 $46.78 AH425 $1,122.72

PC149

Natrasolv Cleaner (CitruSolv) 4 gal/cs Diversey 

Brand 24 Gallon X $20.53 QUOTE $492.72 $46.64 Diversey $1,119.25

PC164

55 Gallon Can Liners (Outdoor), CBC-CRPXC-

47X, 10/10's, 43x47 50 Case X $23.75 CS - HBX8647SKR01 $1,187.50 $20.54 PC47100BK $1,027.00 $18.15 CRPXC47X $907.50 $22.17 PPEC434715K PITT $1,108.50 $35.05 $1,752.41

PC173 Windsor Brush Strips, Versamatick VS14/VS18 48 Each X $17.10 EA - WINDSOR $820.80 $9.73 86002440 $467.04

4" $9.81 18" 

$13.27 $470.88 $636.96 $18.43 Windsor $884.82

PC181 Angle Broom, Rubber Maid with Pole 24 Each X $22.19 EA - RUBBERMAID $532.56 $20.67

FG637500GRA

Y $496.08 $14.15 FG638906BLA $339.60 $7.67 RU6389 $184.08 10" $15 $360.00 $6.25 Rubbermaid $150.07

PC183 Diversey Virex Tb/Altima Tb, 32 oz. 12/cs 20 Case X $34.83 DVO04743 $696.60 $48.70 DV0O4743 $974.00 $50.01 JO4743 $1,000.20 $52.66 Diversey $1,053.25

PC217 Algoma Flat Mops for Waxing, 24" 6 Each X $13.40 EA - ALGOMA $80.40

PC223 Magica Rust Remover, 32oz. 8 Gallon X $29.82 Magica $238.55

PC233 Signatry Foaming Soap 3 Bottle/cs 500 Case X $33.98

8811-03-

SGY00DG $16,990.00

PC235 Carpet Debrowner II 12 Bottle X $131.70/cs $1,580.40

PC237 Hillyard Carpet Spotter, HIL0091004 12 Bottle X $105.31/cs $1,263.72

PC242 3M High Pro Strip Pad, 20" (5/bx), 7300 6 Box X $15.36 EA - 3M $460.80 $56.36 8278 $338.16 $94.60 MMM08278 $567.60 $68.86 MMHP20 $413.16 $72.52/box $435.12 $54.98 3M $329.86

PC256 Nitrile Gloves, Powder Free #8645 XL 20 Box X $7.72 BX - 8645: HAGLN125FX $154.40 $3.57 N-02307 $71.40 $36.95 GNEP-XL-1 $739.00 $25.68 VGA11A14

IF YOU WANT 

20 BOXES OF 

100 THEN 

ORDER 2 

CASES. MUST 

PURCHASE BY 

CASE $513.60 $3.60/box $72.00 $4.58 $91.53

PC259 3M Neutral cleaner, 4 gallons/box 12 Case X $129.58 59865 $1,554.96

PC261 3M SPP Scrub/Recoat Pads, 14", 10/bx, SPP14 8 Box X $59.81 CS - 3M $478.48 $54.32 29596 $434.56 $50.10 MMSPP14 $400.80 $57.35 3M $458.80

PC272 34H 3M Peroxide Cleaner conc. 6/case 144 Bottle X $20.94 59288 $3,015.36 $17.87 3M $2,573.49

PC273 34L 3M TNF Peroxide Cleaner 6/case 72 Bottle X $20.94 59749 $1,507.68 $17.87 3M $1,286.75

Total Awarded $3,786.32

Total 

Awarded $40,609.52

Total 

Awarded $23,313.90

Total 

Awarded $876.31

Total 

Awarded $2,844.12 Total Awarded $1,517.87

Overall 

Total: $72,948.04

Schilling Hillyard Dalco - Provided Full Totals for Quotes, no 

2024-2025 Custodial Supply Bid
RESULTS

Belson Nassco Midland Paper





Blue Highlight = Brand Specific 

UNIT OF VENDOR/
WRPS REF DESCRIPTION OF PRODUCT QTY MEASURE NO SUB MANUF. # Price Brand Total Price Brand Vendor # Notes Total Price MANUF COWI# UM COWI Total

PG005

White theme Pads, red margin, 3 hole 

punched, in pads (6 pads/pkg) 50 Ream $45.17 Tops #63437 $2,258.50 $0.00 $58.64 Tops TOP63437 pk $2,932.00

PG008 Legal Pads, 8 1/2 x 14, 12/pkg 6 Pkg $38.28 Tops #20330 $229.68 $15.33 27442 white $91.98 $8.38 Office Deopt OFD223291 DZ

WHITE 

(CANARY 

SAME) $50.28

PG010

Shorthand Notebooks, 6x9, Gregg Ruled, 80 

sheets/pad 12/pkg 36 Pkg $40.32 Tops #25774 $1,451.52 $11.40 85290

bid as 12/pk. 

Sold 0.95 ea $410.40 $15.00 Rediform RED36746 EA

sold as 

$1.25/ea. 

Option 

OFD307389 

$8/dz/ 70 

sheets $540.00

PG015

Pacon Riverside Super Heavyweight Construction 

Paper, Black, 9 x 12, 50 sheets, 50pkg/cs 200 Ream X Pacon $1.64 Pacon 103029 $328.00 $1.79 tru-ray 1006763

bid & sold as 

50/pk $358.00 $1.85 Pacon PAC103029 PK $370.00

PG016

Pacon Riverside Super Heavyweight Construction 

Paper, Blue, 9 x 12, 50 sheets, 50pkg/cs 200 Ream X Pacon $1.64

Pacon 

#103022 $328.00 $1.19 tru-ray 54027

bid & sold as 

50/pk $238.00 $1.85 Pacon PAC103017 PK $370.00

PG017

Pacon Riverside Super Heavyweight Construction 

Paper, Brown, 9 x 12, 50 sheets, 50pkg/cs 150 Ream X Pacon $1.79

Pacon 

#103024 $268.50 $1.76 tru-ray 54036

Warm Brown - 

bid & sold as 

50/pk $264.00 $1.85 Pacon PAC103025 PK $277.50

PG018

Pacon Riverside Super Heavyweight Construction 

Paper, Gray, 9 x 12, 50 sheets, 50pkg/cs 50 Ream X Pacon $1.75

Pacon 

#103027 $87.50 $1.76 tru-ray 54042

bid & sold as 

50/pk $88.00 $1.85 Pacon PAC103027 PK $92.50

PG019

Pacon Riverside Super Heavyweight Construction 

Paper, Green, 9 x 12, 50 sheets, 50pkg/cs 250 Ream X Pacon $1.69

Pacon#10296

0 $422.50 $2.12 tru-ray 53976

Holiday Green 

- bid & sold as 

50/pk $530.00 $1.85 Pacon PAC102960 PK $370.00

PG020

Pacon Riverside Super Heavyweight Construction 

Paper, Lilac, 9 x 12, 50 sheets, 50pkg/cs 200 Ream X Pacon $1.75

Pacon 

#103009 $350.00 $0.00 $1.85 Pacon PAC103009 PK $370.00

PG021

Pacon Riverside Super Heavyweight Construction 

Paper, Magenta, 9 x 12, 50 sheets, 50pkg/cs 50 Ream X Pacon $1.71

Pacon#10300

0 $85.50 $1.89 tru-ray 53958

bid & sold as 

50/pk $94.50 $1.85 Pacon PAC103000 PK $92.50

PG022

Pacon Riverside Super Heavyweight Construction 

Paper, Pink, 9 x 12, 50 sheets, 50pkg/cs 150 Ream X Pacon $1.86

Pacon 

#103012 $279.00 $1.89 tru-ray 53997

bid & sold as 

50/pk $283.50 $1.85 Pacon PAC103012 PK $277.50

PG023

Pacon Riverside Super Heavyweight Construction 

Paper, Orange, 9 x 12, 50 sheets, 50pkg/cs 100 Ream X Pacon $1.85

Pacon 

#103002 $185.00 $1.91 tru-ray 53964

bid & sold as 

50/pk $191.00 $1.85 Pacon PAC103002 PK $185.00

PG024

Pacon Riverside Super Heavyweight Construction 

Paper, Red, 9 x 12, 50 sheets, 50pkg/cs 350 Ream X Pacon $1.85

Pacon#10343

1 $647.50 $1.91 tru-ray 54648

Fesitive Red - 

bid & sold as 

50/pk $668.50 $1.85 Pacon PAC102993 PK $647.50

PG025

Pacon Riverside Super Heavyweight Construction 

Paper, White, 9 x 12, 50 sheets, 50pkg/cs 400 Ream X Pacon $1.50

Pacon#10302

6 $600.00 $1.51 tru-ray 1006764

bid & sold as 

50/pk $604.00 $1.85 Pacon PAC103026 PK $740.00

PG026

Pacon Riverside Super Heavyweight Construction 

Paper, Yellow, 9 x 12, 50 sheets, 50pkg/cs 300 Ream X Pacon $1.55

Pacon#10300

4 $465.00 $1.89 tru-ray 53970

bid & sold as 

50/pk $567.00 $1.85 Pacon PAC103004 PK $555.00

PG027

Pacon Riverside Super Heavyweight Construction 

Paper, Black, 12 x 18, 50 sheets, 25pkg/cs 50 Ream X Pacon $3.06

Pacon#10300

61 $153.00 $3.33 tru-ray 54150

bid & sold as 

50/pk $166.50 $3.90 Pacon PAC103061 PK $195.00

PG028

Pacon Riverside Super Heavyweight Construction 

Paper, Blue, 12 x 18, 50 sheets, 25pkg/cs 50 Ream X Pacon $3.15

Pacon#10305

4 $157.50 $3.86 tru-ray 54129

bid & sold as 

50/pk $193.00 $3.90 Pacon PAC103049 PK $195.00

PG029

Pacon Riverside Super Heavyweight Construction 

Paper, Brown, 12 x 18, 50 sheets, 25 pkg/cs 25 Ream X Pacon $3.45

Pacon#10305

6 $86.25 $3.50 tru-ray 54138

Warm Brown - 

bid & sold as 

50/pk $87.50 $4.50 Pacon PAC103056 PK $112.50

PG034

Pacon Riverside Super Heavyweight Construction 

Paper, Pink, 12 x 18, 50 sheets, 25 pkg/cs 25 Ream X Pacon $3.17

Pacon#10304

4 $79.25 $3.73 tru-ray 54096

bid & sold as 

50/pk $93.25 $4.90 Pacon PAC103044 PK $122.50

PG035

Pacon Riverside Super Heavyweight Construction 

Paper, Orange, 12 x 18, 50 sheets, 25pkg/cs 25 Ream X Pacon $3.53

Pacon#10303

4 $88.25 $3.84 tru-ray 54063

bid & sold as 

50/pk $96.00 $3.90 Pacon PAC103034 PK $97.50

PG036

Pacon Riverside Super Heavyweight Construction 

Paper, Red, 12 x 18, 50 sheets, 25pkg/cs 50 Ream X Pacon $3.37

Pacon#10343

2 $168.50 $3.84 tru-ray 54651

Festive Red - 

bid & sold as 

50/pk $192.00 $3.90 Pacon PAC102994 PK $195.00

Complete Office

NO BID

General Supply Bid
RESULTS

Marshfield Book School Specialty Midland Paper



PG037

Pacon Riverside Super Heavyweight Construction 

Paper, White, 12 x 18, 50 sheets, 25pkg/cs 200 Ream X Pacon $2.85

Pacon#10305

8 $570.00 $2.99 tru-ray 54141

bid & sold as 

50/pk $598.00 $3.90 Pacon PAC103058 PK $780.00

PG038

Pacon Riverside Super Heavyweight Construction 

Paper, Yellow, 12 x 18, 50 sheets, 25 pkg/cs 25 Ream $3.05

Pacon#10303

6 $76.25 $3.73 tru-ray 54069

bid & sold as 

50/pk $93.25 $3.90 Pacon PAC103036 PK $97.50

PG044 Rolled Paper, Orange, 50#, 36"x1000' 2 Roll $70.89

Pacon#00671

01 $141.78 $65.94 27294 40 lb $131.88 $50.80 Pacon PAC63100 RL $101.60

PG045 Rolled Paper, Red, 50#, 36"x1000' 4 Roll $74.27

Pacon#00670

31 $297.08 $74.20 67167 40 lb flame $296.80 $58.83 Pacon PAC63060 RL $235.32

PG046 Rolled Paper, White, 50#, 36"x1000' 6 Roll $58.06

Pacon#00670

01 $348.36 $48.24 27288 40 lb flame $289.44 $46.60 Pacon PAC63000 RL $279.60

PG048 Riteco, Tagboard, White, Medium, 24x36 200 Sheet X Riteco $0.29 Pacon #5296 $58.00 $0.00 $52.33 Pacon PAC5226 PK COWI 100/PK $104.66

PG050 Railroad Board, Black, 4 ply, 22x28, 100/box 150 Sheet $0.35 Pacon#5481 $52.50 $10.75 1485728

25/pk or .43 

per sheet $1,612.50 $14.75 Pacon PAC54811 CT COWI 25/CT $88.50

PG051 Railroad Board, Blue, 4 ply, 22x28, 100/box 150 Sheet $0.35 Pacon#5465 $52.50 $10.75 1485733

25/pk or .43 

per sheet $1,612.50 $14.75 Pacon PAC54651 CT COWI 25/CT $88.50

PG052 Railroad Board, Brown, 4 ply, 22x28, 100/box 400 Sheet $0.35 Pacon#5469 $140.00 $10.75 1485736

25/pk or .43 

per sheet $4,300.00 $14.75 Pacon PAC54691 CT COWI 25/CT $236.00

PG053 Railroad Board, Canary, 4 ply, 22x28, 100/box 400 Sheet $0.35 Pacon#5472 $140.00 $10.75 1485738

25/pk or .43 

per sheet $4,300.00 $14.75 Pacon PAC54721 CT COWI 25/CT $236.00

PG054 Railroad Board, Green, 4 ply, 22x28, 100/box 200 Sheet $0.35 Pacon#5466 $70.00 $10.75 1485737

25/pk or .43 

per sheet $2,150.00 $14.75 Pacon PAC54661 CT COWI 25/CT $118.00

PG055 Railroad Board, Orange, 4 play, 22x28, 100/box 300 Sheet $0.35 Pacon#5478 $105.00 $10.75 1485731

25/pk or .43 

per sheet $3,225.00 $14.75 Pacon PAC54781 CT COWI 25/CT $177.00

PG056 Railroad Board, Red, 4 ply, 22x28, 100/box 300 Sheet $0.35 Pacon#5475 $105.00 $10.75 1485729

25/pk or .43 

per sheet $3,225.00 $14.75 Pacon PAC54751 CT COWI 25/CT $177.00

PG057 Railroad Board, White, 4 ply, 22x28, 100/box 300 Sheet $0.28 Pacon5460 $84.00 $7.50 1485727

25/pk or .30 

per sheet $2,250.00 $33.42 Pacon PAC54620 CT COWI 50/CT $401.04

PG058 Pencils, Beginner Soft Lead, With Eraser, 12/pkg 100 Pkg $4.10 Dixon 13308 $410.00 $2.00 84449 $200.00 $3.87 Dixon DIX13308 DZ $387.00

PG059 Pencils, No. 2 w/eraser, 12/pkg 100 Pkg $1.27 Dixon 14402 $127.00 $0.74 83276 $74.00 $0.65 Office Depot

OFD825488D

Z DZ $65.00

PG060 X-ACTO KS Manual Pencil Sharpner, 1/box 50 Each X X-ACTO $12.87

X-ACTO 

1031LMR $643.50 $10.59 380144 $529.50 $10.50 X-ACTO EPI1031LMR EA $525.00

PG061 Pentel R.S.V.P. BK90 Pens, BLACK, 12/box 125 Box X Pentel $5.52 Pentel BK90A $690.00 $6.39 77367 $798.75 $5.15 Pentel PENBK90A DZ $643.75

PG062 Pentel R.S.V.P. BK90 Pens, BLUE, 12/box 75 Box X Pentel $5.52 Pentel BK90C $414.00 $6.39 1582644 $479.25 $5.15 pentel PENBK90C DZ $386.25

PG064 Paper Mate Flair Pens, Black, 12/box 100 Box X Paper Mate $15.12

Papermate 

84030152 $1,512.00 $14.35 79486 $1,435.00 $11.15 paper mate PAP840152 DZ $1,115.00

PG065 Paper Mate Flair Pens, Red, 12/box 150 Box X Paper Mate $15.12

Papermate 

8420152 $2,268.00 $14.35 79487 $2,152.50 $11.15 paper mate PAP8120152 DZ $1,672.50

PG070 Magic Marker, Sharpie, FP, Black, 12/box 200 Box X Sharpie $10.20 Sharpie 30001 $2,040.00 $10.14 77399 $2,028.00 $7.50 sharpie SAN30001 DZ $1,500.00

PG071 Magic Marker, Sharpie, FP, Blue, 12/box 50 Box X Sharpie $10.20 Sharpie 30003 $510.00 $10.14 77401 $507.00 $7.50 sharpie SAN30003 DZ $375.00

PG072 Magic Marker, Sharpie,FP, Green, 12/box 50 Box X Sharpie $10.20 Sharpie 30004 $510.00 $10.14 77402 $507.00 $7.50 sharpie SAN30004 DZ $375.00

PG078 Drawing Crayons, 8 crayons/box 24 Box $0.65 Crayola 52008 $15.60 $0.40 25948 $9.60 $0.64 crayola CYO523008 BX $15.36

PG090 Fasteners, No. 4, 100/box 10 Box $1.32

Charles 

Leonard 4RBP $13.20 $1.26 59952 $12.60 $2.23 officemate OIC99814 BX $22.30

PG092 Paper Clips, Jumbo Size, 100 clips/box, 10 box/cs 500 Box $0.51

Charles 

Leonard 301E $255.00 $8.91 1500601 $4,455.00 $0.56 Office Depot OFD308239 PK

SOLD AT 

$5.60/PK $280.00

PG095 Stapler, Standard 100 Each X Bostitch B515 $4.00 Bostitch B515 $400.00 $5.51 2132561 $551.00 $3.93 bostitch b515

BOSB515BLA

CK EA $393.00

PG097 Staple Remover 10 Each $0.51

Charles 

Leonard 050 $5.10 $0.43 2133015 $4.30 $0.50 office depot OFD2427111 EA $5.00

PG098

Scissors, 8" Teachers, Stainelss blade/plasitc 

handle 50 Each X Fiskars $3.35

Fiskars 

1067149 $167.50 $5.19 1326607 $259.50 $1.15 office depot OFD6822496 EA

BLUE/GRAY 

HANDLE $57.50

PG100 Glue, Elmer's, 4 oz bottles, 12/pkg 60 Pkg X Elmers $19.20 Elmers 304 $1,152.00 $13.80 1337116

bid as 12/pk 

or 1.15 ea $828.00 $0.75 elmers EPIE304 EA

SOLD AT 

.75/EA $540.00

PG101

Tape, Scotch, No. 6000, Transparent, 1/2", 12 roll 

pkg 100 Pkg X Scotch $13.68

Scotch 

600121296 $1,368.00 $22.68 40533

bid as 12/pk 

or 1.89 ea $2,268.00 $19.20 scotch MMM600K12 PK $1,920.00

PG103

Tape Dispensers, 2 piece construction, smoke 

color 200 Each $0.55

Charles 

Leonard 

81034 $110.00 $0.88 2025314 $176.00 $0.45 business sourt BSN00465 EA $90.00

PG104 Masking Tape, Ecomony, 3/4"12/pkg 32 Pkg X Ecomony $17.76

Economy 

260018A $568.32 $14.82 1583443 highland $474.24 $14.17 333 - highland MMM260018A PK $453.44

PG107 Manilla Folders, 1/3 Cut, 100/box 125 Box $7.46 Tops 75213 $932.50 $8.80 15741 $1,100.00 $8.64 office depot OFD810838 BX $1,080.00

PG108 Expansion Folders, 3 1/2", 25/box 25 Box $39.75

Tops 

1524EOX $993.75 $45.63 1600146 $1,140.75 $23.25 smead SMD73224 BX $581.25

PG112 Envelopes, 9 x 12, no clasp, 100 PER BOX 100 Box $11.00

Western 

States 4920E $1,100.00 $13.20 2013924 white $1,320.00 $7.25 office depot OFD3683082 BX $725.00

PG115 Index Cards, 3 x 5, Plain, 100/pkg 40 Pkg $0.45 Tops 30 $18.00 $0.46 88708 $18.40 $0.45 office depot OFD3073798 PK $18.00

PG116 Index Cards, 4 x 6, Ruled, 100/pkg 125 Pkg $0.87 Tops 41 $108.75 $0.82 88710 $102.50 $1.44

bsiness 

source BSN65261 PK $180.00

NO BID



PG122 Adding Machine Tape/Paper 50 Roll $0.51

Superior 

Paper 51518 $25.50 $2.08 2134154

bid as ea or 

3/pk at 3.80 $104.00 $0.54 iconex

ICX90740510

RL RL $27.00

PG123 Cotton Twine 12 Each $2.70

Nassco 

R48800 $32.40 $7.18 159597 $86.16

PG126 Correction Fluid, Multipurpose, 12/pkg 10 Pkg X

Paper Mate / 

Liquid Paper $15.96

Papermate 

5640115 $159.60 $15.20 1495148 $152.00 $12.67 paper mate PAP5640115 DZ $126.70

PG128 Post-It Notes, 1 1/2 x 2, 12/pkg 200 Pkg X Post-it-Notes $6.84

Post it notes 

653YW $1,368.00 $6.17 40548 $1,234.00 $5.26 post it MMM653YW PK $1,052.00

PG130 Post-It Notes, 3 x 3, 12/pkg 200 Pkg X Post-it-Notes $13.68

Post it notes 

6534YW $2,736.00 $14.00 28622 $2,800.00 $11.42 post it MMM654YW PK $2,284.00

PG150 Blue Tac Poster Putty, 2 oz. pkg, 12/cs 160 Each X Scotch $1.65 Scotch 860 $264.00 $0.00 $1.20 scotch MMM860 EA $192.00

PG151 Pentel R.S.V.P. Pens, GREEN, 12/box 200 Box X Pentel $5.52 Pentel BK90D $1,104.00 $6.62 1582645 fine tip $1,324.00 $7.75 pentel PENBK91D DZ $1,550.00

PG153 Whiteboard Dry Erasers, Sanford #81505 200 Each X

Sanford#8150

5 $2.57 Sanford 81505 $514.00 $2.39 76878 $478.00 $1.90

sanford#8150

5 SAN81505 EA $380.00

PG154

Whiteboard Sanford Expo 2 Dry Er BLACK, 

12/box 200 Box X Sanford Expo $14.04

Sanford Expo 

80001 $2,808.00 $14.20 1333744 $2,840.00 $10.00 sanford expo SAN80001 DZ $2,000.00

PG157 Whiteboard Sanford Expo 2 Dry Er RED, 12/box 50 Box X Sanford Expo $14.04

Sanford Epxo 

80002 $702.00 $14.20 1333745 $710.00 $10.00 sanford expo SAN80002 DZ $500.00

Total 

Awarded $9,818.00

Total 

Awarded $1,241.40

Total 

Awarded $17,751.69

Overall Total $28,811.09

NO BID





UNIT OF VENDOR/
WRPS REF DESCRIPTION OF PRODUCT QTY MEASURE NO SUB MANUF # Quoted Price Vendor Item # Notes Total Quoted Vendor Item # Total Quoted Vendor Item # Notes Total Quoted Vendor Item Total Quoted Vendor Quoted Vendor Quoted Vendor Quoted Vendor 

PN002 BAND AIDS, 3/4" X 3", COVERLET ONLY, 100/BOX 200 Box x Coverlet $3.77 22020M $754.00 $5.45 $1,090.00 $0.00 $5.58 $1,116.00

PN003 BAND AIDS, 1" X 3", COVERLET ONLY, 100/BOX 200 Box X Coverlet $4.01 22021M $802.00 $5.95 $1,190.00 $0.00 $6.44

PN004 BAND AIDS, 2" X 4 1/2", GENERIC FABRIC, 50/BOX 50 Box x Coverlet $3.22 261840 $161.00 $10.50 4" x 2 3/4" $525.00 $0.00 $12.84

PN005 POROUS FIRST AID TAPE, 1" X 10 YARD ROLLS 400 Roll $1.08 32019M $432.00 $1.94 OUR ITEM #70070/CURAD $776.00 $0.00 $0.95 $380.00

PN006 COTTON BALLS, STERILE, MEDIUM, 500/BOX 8 Box - $0.00

PN012 GAUZE PAD, 4" x 4", STERILE 50 Box $7.46 35270 $373.00 $6.95

OUR ITEM 

#16920/DYNAREX $347.50 $0.00 $7.06 $353.00

PN013 4-WING FABRIC BANDAGE, 3 X 3, 50/BOX 8 Box $5.01 261834 $40.08 $6.70 OUR ITEM #5316/DYNAREX $53.60 $0.00 $4.96 $39.68

PN014 ELASTIC GAUZE BANDAGE, 3" X 4/5 YDS, 12 RLS/PKG 500 Roll $2.46 10022 $1,230.00 $0.88 OUR ITEM #15211/DYNAREX $440.00 $0.00 $0.84 $420.00

PN016 MEDICINE DISPENSER CUPS, 1 OZ, 100 CUPS/PKG 125 Sleeves $0.93 39002M $116.25 $1.50 OUR ITEM #22901/PRO ADVANTAGE $187.50 $0.00 $1.39 $173.75

PN023 NON-STERILE SPONGES, 4 X 4, 8 PLY, 200 PKG 125 Pkg $3.36 267672 $420.00 $0.00 $3.72 $465.00

PN028 Fingertip Bandages, 1 3/4 x 3-Fabric Generic Only 12 Box $3.80 261836 $45.60 $5.69 OUR ITEM #5310/DYNAREX $68.28 $0.00 $4.79 $57.48

PN032 COTTON TIPPED APPLICATIONS, 3", NONSTERILE 200 Pkg $7.36 10131 $1,472.00 $0.67 OUR ITEM #14205/DYNAREX $134.00 $0.00 $0.49 $98.00

PN035

GENERIC SELF-ADHERENT WRAP, LATEX FREE, 1" X 5 

YARDS/ROLL 100 Roll $28.23 51005 $2,823.00 $1.03

OUR ITEM 

#15944/DYNAREX $103.00 $0.00 $1.30 $130.00

PN036

GENERIC SELF-ADHERENT WRAP, LATEX FREE, 2" X 5 

YARDS/ROLL 50 Roll $60.53 52005 $3,026.50 $1.64

OUR ITEM 

#15945/DYNAREX $82.00 $0.00 $1.90 $95.00

PN037

GENERIC SELF -ADHERENT WRAP LATEX FREE, 3" X 5 

YARDS/ROLL 100 Roll $49.70 53035 $4,970.00 $1.98

OUR ITEM 

#15946/DYNAREX $198.00 $0.00 $2.25 $225.00

PN302 PF VINYL EXAM GLOVES, MEDIUM, #3502-IMC, 100/BOX 100 Box x 3502-IMC - $0.00 -

PN302

PF VINYL EXAM GLOVES, MEDIUM, 100/BOX, MV202 

Elara Prepmed 100 Box x MV202 - $3.65 VP235

mv202 

discont. $365.00

PN303 PF VINYL EXAM GLOVES, LARGE, #3503-IMC, 100/BOX 200 Box x 3503-IMC - $0.00

PN303

PF VINYL EXAM GLOVES, LARGE, 100/BOX, MV203 

Elara Prepmed 200 Box x MV203 $3.65 VP236

MV203 

discont. $730.00 -

PN305

ZIPPER SEAL-TOP RECLOSABLE BAGS, 4" X 4", 2 MIL, 

CLEAR, 100/PKG 125 Pkg $1.74

OUR ITEM #23415/RD 

PLASTICS $217.50 $0.00 $1.75 $218.75

PN306

ZIPPER SEAL-TOP RECLOSABLE BAGS, 5" X 7", 2 MIL, 

CLEAR, 100/PKG 12 Pkg $2.20 29670 $26.40 $2.95 OUR ITEM #23418/RD PLASTICS $35.40 $0.00 $2.92

PN307 NON-STERILE SPONGES, 3 x 3, 8PLY 200pkg 10 Pkg $2.30 267670 $23.00 $2.43

PN309 PF VINYL EXAM GLOVES, X-LARGE, 3504-IMC, 100/BOX 200 Box x 3504-IMC $3.65 vp238 $730.00

PN309

PF VINYL EXAM GLOVES, X-LARGE, 100/BOX, MV204 

Elara Prepmed 200 Box x MV204

Total $2,348.25 Total Awarded $948.00 Total $1,825.00 Total $937.68
Overall Total $6,058.93

Nassco School Health

FIRST AID SUPPLY BID
RESULTS

Pricing held until June 30th 2024

Medco School Nurse Supply Dalco Complete Office STAPLES Macgill

NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
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